
COMMUNITY AND TECHNICAL COLLEGE SYSTEM OF WEST VIRGINIA

Bastian & Harris, Architects

405 Rockholly Road

ROOF RESTORATION Charleston, WV  25314

ADVANCED TECHNOLOGY CENTER 304/345-0405

NEW RIVER COMMUNITY AND TECHNICAL COLLEGE - GHENT

RFB 21044

Design Roofing, 

LLC

Harris Brothers 

Roofing

Insulated 

Roofing 

Contractors

Mecklenburg 

Roofing

Midwest 

Restoration 

Group

Roof MDS, LLC
Roof Tech Pro., 

Ltd.

Tri-State 

Roofing

BASE BID No Bid $987,000.00 $189,751.00 $372,737.50 $249,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Prices

UP 1 - Additional New 

Fascia (per10' Section)
$133.00 $150.00 $112.50 $300.00

UP 2 - Deducted 10' 

Section of Fascia (per 10' 

Section)

$133.00 $150.00 ($62.00) $300.00

UP 3 - Add or Deduct for 

New Fasteners (per 25 

count)

$13.00 $100.00 $81.25 $50.00

Contractor's License No. Yes Yes Yes No
Purchasing Affidavit Yes Yes Yes No

Drug Free Affidavit Yes Yes Yes No

Addenda Acknowledgement Yes Yes Yes Yes

Subcontractor List Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes
Casheer's 

Check

BID TABULATION FORM  

August 4, 2020  @  3:00 pm
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